Davis, Debbie

From: Melanie Rajaniemi

Sent: Wednesday, October 23, 2019 8:48 AM

To: Davis, Debbie

Cc: ranchkimball4@gmail.com

Subject: RE: [Leicester MA] A simple FOIA request (Sent by Ranch C. Kimball, ranchkimball4
@gmail.com)

Good morning,

We have received the following quarterly payments through DOR under the local tax option:

FY19 Dec-Feb: 193,328.26
FY19 Mar-May: 176,650.80 P
FY20Jun-Aug: 140,236.97 o, Em

R o
Please let me know if you require any further information. Y]
Sincerely,
Melanie

Melanie Rajaniemi
Treasurer Collector
Town of Leicester

3 Washburn Square
Leicester MA 01524
Phone: 508-892-7002
Fax: 508-892-7070

----Original Message-----

From: Davis, Debbie <Davisd@leicesterma.org>

Sent: Wednesday, October 23, 2019 7:45 AM

To: Melanie Rajaniemi <RajaniemiM@leicesterma.org>

Cc: ranchkimballd@gmail.com

Subject: FW: [Leicester MA] A simple FOIA reguest {Sent by Ranch C. Kimball, ranchkimbali4 @gmail.com})

Melanie,

A public records request.
Thank you,

Debbie

From: cmsmailer@civicplus.com <cmsmailer@civicplus.com>

Sent: Wednesday, October 23, 2019 7:37 AM

To: Davis, Debbie <Davisd @leicesterma.org>

Subject: [Leicester MA] A simple FOIA request (Sent by Ranch C. Kimball, ranchkimbali4@gmail.com)

Hello davisd,




v Ranch C. Kimball (ranchkimball4@gmail.com) has sent you a message via your contact form
(https://www leicesterma.org/user/15701/contact) at Leicester MA.

if you don't want to receive such e-mails, you can change your settings at
https://www.leicesterma.org/user/15701/edit.

Message:
Dear Clerk Davis:

Now that the Commonwealth's DOR has to sent to Leicester its monthly tax payments due the Town under the
Marijuana Local Tax Option, can you please let me know the monthly payments made to the Town, for the months of
November

2018 through July 20197

Thank you -- Ranch Kimball, Brookline MA




