Davis, Debbie

_ _ R
From: Genereuy, David
Sent: Monday, July 20, 2020 4:50 PM
To: Davis, Debbie; Ben Morris; Robert Mercer
Cc: Historical Commission
Subject: RE: Leicester Water

Hello Mr. Mercer,

The Town received $20,921.50 from Worcester for the Airport, based on a property value of $1,403,186 last fiscal year
The Town received $25,023.98 from Worcester for water protection land, based on a property value of $1,678,336 last
fiscal year.

Both of these amounts are based on the valuation/1000 times the tax rate, so they are paying the proper value of the
land.

I am not aware of any fees paid by Worcester for water in Leicester, as they own those resources.
David A. Genhereux

David A. Genereux

Town Administrator

Town of Leicester

3 Washburn Square

Leicester, MA 01524

Telephone: (508) 892-7000

Fax: (508) 892-7070

Email: genereuxd@leicesterma.org

“Please remember that the Secretary of State has determined that email is a public record”

From: Davis, Debbie <Davisd@leicesterma.org>

Sent: Thursday, July 16, 2020 11:09 AM

To: Genereux, David <genereuxd @leicesterma.org>; Ben Morris <bmorris@cvrwd.com>
Cc: Historical Commission <jlennerton@®@aol.com>

Subject: FW: Leicester Water

Hello all,
Robert Mercer is looking for some information on the below subject. Please help him.
Debbie

From: Robert Mercer <rwmercerjr@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, July 16, 2020 11:04 AM

To: Davis, Debbie <Davisd@leicesterma.org>
Subject: Leicester Water




Do you know if Worcester pays for the water they get from Leicester either from gallons, or in taxes, or some other way.
They claim to owns or control a lot of Land and Resourses of Leicester. And the same question about ali of the land at
the Airport.

It seems like Leicester is a support mechanism for Worcester without adequate reimbursement.

Feel free to forward my request to anyone who can help including our Rep.

Thanks
Bob

Sent from my iPad




